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Although leadership is the hot topic on conference agendas and book tours, most people who find themselves
in positions of leadership have little or no training for the role. They simply continue to make the same old
mistakes.

With additional and newly updated material, this leadership classic reveals the most common errors that
leaders consistently make-regardless of training or age-and the way to stop these bad habits from
undermining their positive talents and accomplishments.

Whether you are leading a company, a ministry, a Girl Scout troop, or your family, The Top Ten Mistakes
Leaders Make is a must-read for anyone who wants to lead others effectively.

"If you're like me, you've grown weary of the published cookie-cutter approaches on how to lead effectively.
And so has Hans Finzel. He drills to the core of the current issues on effective leadership."
-Charles R. Swindoll, author and president of Dallas Theological Seminary

"This is one of the most practical books on leadership I have in my own library. If you are serious about
becoming a better leader, you will want to read this book."
-John C. Maxwell, author, speaker, and founder of the INJOY Group
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From reader reviews:

George Oneal:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important act, like looking
for your favorite e-book and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you can add
your knowledge by the guide entitled The Top Ten Mistakes Leaders Make. Try to make the book The Top
Ten Mistakes Leaders Make as your good friend. It means that it can to be your friend when you truly feel
alone and beside that of course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for yourself. The
book makes you a lot more confidence because you can know every thing by the book. So , let me make new
experience as well as knowledge with this book.

Michael Joslyn:

This The Top Ten Mistakes Leaders Make are usually reliable for you who want to certainly be a successful
person, why. The reason why of this The Top Ten Mistakes Leaders Make can be among the great books you
must have is actually giving you more than just simple examining food but feed an individual with
information that might be will shock your prior knowledge. This book is actually handy, you can bring it
almost everywhere and whenever your conditions in the e-book and printed people. Beside that this The Top
Ten Mistakes Leaders Make giving you an enormous of experience including rich vocabulary, giving you
trial of critical thinking that we understand it useful in your day exercise. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Victor Loy:

This book untitled The Top Ten Mistakes Leaders Make to be one of several books that will best seller in
this year, that's because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to
buy this specific book in the book retail store or you can order it via online. The publisher in this book sells
the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, since you can read this book in your Touch
screen phone. So there is no reason to you to past this e-book from your list.

Robert Tanaka:

The Top Ten Mistakes Leaders Make can be one of your nice books that are good idea. We recommend that
straight away because this publication has good vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in vocab, easy
to understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information. The article author giving his/her effort to place
every word into pleasure arrangement in writing The Top Ten Mistakes Leaders Make but doesn't forget the
main place, giving the reader the hottest along with based confirm resource information that maybe you can
be certainly one of it. This great information could drawn you into completely new stage of crucial
pondering.
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