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This is the first book to explore this emergent role of the nursing profession. It examines the unique legal,
regulatory and professional issues this neoteric mode of nursing practice presents. Telenursing as a subset of
telehealth is defined and a review of its history, present status, and future in the U.S. health care system is
discussed. Concomitant legal accountability and risk for malpractice liability are examined. Risk
management strategies and survival tactics in the event of a lawsuit are presented—particularly the legal
significance of, and essential need for, defensive nursing documentation. A brief overview of malpractice
law is provided and the essentials of requisite malpractice insurance for the telenurse practitioner are
outlined.

The book also addresses a number of other professional, regulatory, and licensure issues, particularly the
contentious issue of multistate licensing and the various models to facilitate it that are being offered, and
rejected, by nursing organizations and associations. The anticipated changes in our health care delivery
system that will be engendered by breakthroughs in science and technology are described. The implications
of such changes for patients as consumers of health care are analyzed—particularly the privacy and
confidentiality of electronic medical records.
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From reader reviews:

Kelly Cohn:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to understand everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or perhaps goal; it means
that e-book has different type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They
are reading whatever they consider because their hobby is definitely reading a book. Consider the person
who don't like reading a book? Sometime, individual feel need book after they found difficult problem as
well as exercise. Well, probably you will need this Telenursing: Nursing Practice in Cyberspace.

Jason Serrano:

Throughout other case, little folks like to read book Telenursing: Nursing Practice in Cyberspace. You can
choose the best book if you'd prefer reading a book. As long as we know about how is important a book
Telenursing: Nursing Practice in Cyberspace. You can add information and of course you can around the
world by just a book. Absolutely right, simply because from book you can learn everything! From your
country till foreign or abroad you will end up known. About simple point until wonderful thing you could
know that. In this era, we are able to open a book or even searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You
need to use it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's examine.

Keith Dunn:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they are still students or that for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that query above. Every person has
diverse personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they don't
want do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Telenursing: Nursing Practice in
Cyberspace. All type of book are you able to see on many resources. You can look for the internet solutions
or other social media.

Luis Gazaway:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you can have it in
e-book approach, more simple and reachable. This Telenursing: Nursing Practice in Cyberspace can give you
a lot of pals because by you considering this one book you have factor that they don't and make an individual
more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of one step for you to get success. This
reserve offer you information that might be your friend doesn't learn, by knowing more than other make you
to be great individuals. So , why hesitate? Let us have Telenursing: Nursing Practice in Cyberspace.
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