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If you regard ascension as something associated only with a line-up of planets on December 21, 2012, you
haven't read Playing The Ascension Game by author Diana Stone. In this guidebook, ascension is described
as a work in progress that extends well past the highly publicized and controversial 2012 date. The author
deftly introduces readers to the fundamentals of Alternative Spirituality, the basic stepping stones that lay
down the foundation for personal transformation. This book is for everyone who can maintain a flexible
belief system as you are led by baby steps along a continuum that culminates in the key to an enlightened
human capable of traversing higher dimensions. The book's claim that game playing is the only thing that
will solve humanity's problems over the next hundred years has some startling statistics on its side. Playing a
game is the only place where the impossible is possible, as it engages the right brain intuition, opening the
door to all knowledge in the Universe. The author shares autobiographical adventures that will have you
laughing as you learn. She documents her work with her Spirit Teacher that eventually laid down the model
for the Western 21st-century shaman. There are guidelines for working with ETs, guides, psychics and gurus,
as well as techniques for developing psychic skills and communicating with your body. There are
lightworkers who have done everything right, but everything has gone wrong. Diana Stone's profound
insights into their true soul mission reveals that they are neither crazy nor wrong. Other stories drawn from
her free newsletter document her readers' hilarious and shocking encounters with wild synchronicities and
the Trickster archetype. This 7" by 10", 2 ¾ pound, 548-page monster tome speeds you through a laundry list
of subjects as wide as the Grand Canyon, and as unique and versatile as the author herself. Among numerous
others, topics include: clearing negative energies, shocking health care secrets, humanity's true parents, the
nuclear device detonated in biblical times, preparing for ascension, breaking soul contracts, toxic
relationships, spiritual emergencies, healing ancestral wounds, crossing timelines, activating the pineal gland
and 12-strand DNA, America's secret destiny, the new race of humans, and your true soul mission. The most
powerful chapter in this book may well be "Ho'oponopono," the planet's greatest healing technique
interpreted in detail by the author. Yes! game playing is for everybody, and Playing The Ascension Game is
everybody's ticket to the ascension process. The author's signature story-telling style has brought lecture
audiences to their feet in standing ovations since the 1970s. Diana is a woman of many talents. She serves an
international clientele as a professional astrologer. She is also a shamanic healer who works with clients
world wide by remote. She and her brother, Duane Henkle, have been leading edge voices in the ascension
movement since 1997. They worked with Pleiadian ETs to bring through a popular technique for activating
the lightbody, the subject of a book they later coauthored The Lightbody Activation Manual. Pleiadian
Beings once again merged with Duane Henkle to bring through the Galactic Activation. Playing The
Ascension Game introduces this activation for the first time in print!
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From reader reviews:

Stevie Mozingo:

With other case, little individuals like to read book Playing the Ascension Game: A Guidebook For
Navigating the Third Dimension Step-By-Step to Higher Consciousness (no matter who the hell you are)
(Technology of Ascension) (Volume 3). You can choose the best book if you appreciate reading a book.
Provided that we know about how is important some sort of book Playing the Ascension Game: A
Guidebook For Navigating the Third Dimension Step-By-Step to Higher Consciousness (no matter who the
hell you are) (Technology of Ascension) (Volume 3). You can add knowledge and of course you can around
the world with a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can learn everything! From your
country until eventually foreign or abroad you will end up known. About simple factor until wonderful thing
you are able to know that. In this era, we are able to open a book or maybe searching by internet system. It is
called e-book. You need to use it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's learn.

Shannon Harvey:

As people who live in the modest era should be change about what going on or data even knowledge to make
these keep up with the era that is always change and move forward. Some of you maybe may update
themselves by reading books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the problems coming to you actually
is you don't know which one you should start with. This Playing the Ascension Game: A Guidebook For
Navigating the Third Dimension Step-By-Step to Higher Consciousness (no matter who the hell you are)
(Technology of Ascension) (Volume 3) is our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, because
book serves what you want and want in this era.

Robbie Stamant:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make anyone to
understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information better to share. You
can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and soon. You
will see that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The actual book that recommended
for your requirements is Playing the Ascension Game: A Guidebook For Navigating the Third Dimension
Step-By-Step to Higher Consciousness (no matter who the hell you are) (Technology of Ascension) (Volume
3) this book consist a lot of the information on the condition of this world now. This particular book was
represented how can the world has grown up. The vocabulary styles that writer require to explain it is easy to
understand. The particular writer made some study when he makes this book. That is why this book
appropriate all of you.

Jean Gadson:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Playing the Ascension Game: A Guidebook



For Navigating the Third Dimension Step-By-Step to Higher Consciousness (no matter who the hell you are)
(Technology of Ascension) (Volume 3) was vibrant and of course has pictures on the website. As we know
that book Playing the Ascension Game: A Guidebook For Navigating the Third Dimension Step-By-Step to
Higher Consciousness (no matter who the hell you are) (Technology of Ascension) (Volume 3) has many
kinds or style. Start from kids until youngsters. For example Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and
believe you are the character on there. So , not at all of book are usually make you bored, any it offers up you
feel happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best book for you and try to like reading that.
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