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The competition for jobs is steep, and employers can afford to be picky. Being a certified Revit Associate or
Professional is an excellent way to distinguish yourself amongst other professionals and provide potential
employers a sense of security knowing that you possess a high level of knowledge and skills.

This book is geared toward users who have been using Revit for at least six months and are ready to pursue
their official Autodesk Revit certification. Autodesk offers two levels of certification exams: an Associate
certificate and a Professional certificate. This book uses step-by-step instructions to prepare you to take both
of these tests.

The Unofficial Revit 2012 Certification Exam Guide is a concise book that will get you up to speed quickly
on the nature of the exam's questions so you will know exactly what to expect on exam day. This book
provides the most comprehensive and thorough preparation for theses exams available. Included are
exercises and practice questions which simulate knowledge users should have in order to pass the
certification exams.

Why is this book the Unofficial guide?
Even though Autodesk has stopped publishing their own exam guide they still reserve the right to publish
any official training courseware. If you plan to take an Autodesk Revit 2012 certification exam then this is
the only book for you. The most recent version of the Autodesk Official Training Courseware is for the Revit
2008 Certified user exam, and Revit has undergone several significant interface changes since then which
effect the questions on the test.
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From reader reviews:

Vera Forde:

The book The Unofficial Revit 2012 Certification Exam Guide can give more knowledge and information
about everything you want. Why must we leave a good thing like a book The Unofficial Revit 2012
Certification Exam Guide? Several of you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim that will
book can give many information for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer with your book.
Knowledge or facts that you take for that, you may give for each other; you may share all of these. Book The
Unofficial Revit 2012 Certification Exam Guide has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and
massive function for you. You can appear the enormous world by open up and read a book. So it is very
wonderful.

Roxanne Harrelson:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the headline The Unofficial
Revit 2012 Certification Exam Guide suitable to you? Often the book was written by well known writer in
this era. Typically the book untitled The Unofficial Revit 2012 Certification Exam Guideis the one of several
books that will everyone read now. This kind of book was inspired lots of people in the world. When you
read this reserve you will enter the new way of measuring that you ever know previous to. The author
explained their thought in the simple way, therefore all of people can easily to understand the core of this
book. This book will give you a lots of information about this world now. In order to see the represented of
the world within this book.

Corey Smith:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book specifically book entitled The
Unofficial Revit 2012 Certification Exam Guide your mind will drift away trough every dimension,
wandering in most aspect that maybe unidentified for but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging each
and every word written in a e-book then become one form conclusion and explanation in which maybe you
never get previous to. The The Unofficial Revit 2012 Certification Exam Guide giving you a different
experience more than blown away your brain but also giving you useful data for your better life on this era.
So now let us teach you the relaxing pattern at this point is your body and mind will likely be pleased when
you are finished looking at it, like winning a sport. Do you want to try this extraordinary investing spare time
activity?

Theodore Mullis:

This The Unofficial Revit 2012 Certification Exam Guide is brand-new way for you who has fascination to
look for some information as it relief your hunger of knowledge. Getting deeper you upon it getting
knowledge more you know or you who still having little bit of digest in reading this The Unofficial Revit
2012 Certification Exam Guide can be the light food for you personally because the information inside this
kind of book is easy to get simply by anyone. These books acquire itself in the form that is certainly



reachable by anyone, that's why I mean in the e-book contact form. People who think that in publication
form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this publication is the answer. So there is not any in reading a
reserve especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for anyone. So , don't
miss that! Just read this e-book type for your better life and knowledge.
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