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Melody Logan was as alone as a solitary gull, with only the wild Atlantic wind to lift her spirits....
When Melody Logan's mother died in a car accident, Melody lost the last shred of family she had ever
known. She was practically a stranger to the Logans, her wealthy relatives on Cape Cod, where she now
drifted on a sea of dark secrets. In the eyes of gentle Aunt Sara, Melody was a replacement for her dead
daughter, while for Uncle Jacob she was a reminder of the family's shameful past. Only good-hearted Cary
seemed to care, and since it was revealed that she and Cary weren't truly cousins, the affection that had
always surged between them now crested in thrilling waves.
But Melody knew she could never truly echo Cary's loving promises until she discovered her own buried
identity. Despite Grandma Olivia's daggerlike threats, Melody sought out Belinda, a mysterious, half-crazy
woman who was her real grandmother. Belinda gave Melody hope -- and a glimmer of the pearls of truth she
knew were hidden in the shifting Cape Cod sands. Somehow, someday, the story of her past would be her
hard-won treasure, to be savored in a world of sunshine and happiness...where she truly belonged.
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From reader reviews:

Madeline Wayt:

Within other case, little individuals like to read book Heart Song. You can choose the best book if you'd
prefer reading a book. As long as we know about how is important some sort of book Heart Song. You can
add knowledge and of course you can around the world by just a book. Absolutely right, simply because
from book you can understand everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you can be
known. About simple matter until wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, we could open a book or
even searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel weary to go to the
library. Let's examine.

Carl Adams:

Do you considered one of people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained inside the straightway,
hold on guys this particular aren't like that. This Heart Song book is readable through you who hate those
perfect word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for enjoyable looking at experience without
leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to deliver to you. The writer associated with Heart Song
content conveys the idea easily to understand by many people. The printed and e-book are not different in the
information but it just different such as it. So , do you still thinking Heart Song is not loveable to be your top
collection reading book?

Wendy Ray:

The knowledge that you get from Heart Song may be the more deep you looking the information that hide
into the words the more you get thinking about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to know but
Heart Song giving you joy feeling of reading. The article writer conveys their point in selected way that can
be understood by means of anyone who read it because the author of this book is well-known enough. This
particular book also makes your own personal vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand then
can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We propose you for having this
particular Heart Song instantly.

Daniel Nelson:

This Heart Song usually are reliable for you who want to be described as a successful person, why. The main
reason of this Heart Song can be among the great books you must have will be giving you more than just
simple looking at food but feed anyone with information that maybe will shock your before knowledge. This
book will be handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and whenever your conditions at e-book and printed
versions. Beside that this Heart Song forcing you to have an enormous of experience for example rich
vocabulary, giving you trial of critical thinking that we realize it useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it
and luxuriate in reading.
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